TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

IR £ U594
Che Gazette of India

1.5 -3, Te.-31.-10092024-257055
CG-DL -E-10092024-257055

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —ave 3—SI-T@7 (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

¥. 518] T Reeht, TTeraTe, s 10, 2024/978 19, 1946
No. 518] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 10, 2024/BHADRA 19, 1946
FIAIRE F HATAT

75 fReett, 10 Rrawaw, 2024

A, 560(37)—Fr=1T AL, Q@ T ot sterwar €@fgar, 2016 (2016 #1 31) #¥

T 189 FY IT-4T=T (5) % AT IfSa & 239 Y IT-4TRT (2) F T (IT) FIT T&T TFAT FT TN Fd
TU, AT fIaTaT SiiY o STeqmar a1 (AeqeT 37T Taeql & aad, 9 ¥ JaT & 977 [Faed i o)
9w, 2016 FT SiI¥ FeTed w2 & orw Feferied Fam a@ T g, 1iqQ-

1. (1) = =T &7 "ferd 909 AT [Tarar sl e STeAar are (reqef oY qaedi & aad, 9
T FAT F v Faee S o) Hemrae 77, 2024 2

(2) T TSI H T T I ATE Bl T gl

2. AT fRaTeT ST oTrer Srequar S (37edeT Y qaed % oq, 9 3T qaT % o A i
oret) 71w, 2016 (& =8 T TTq 3 (90 Fgr a1 ) ®, w4 9 -

(i) sS9F=T (1) 7, “4,50,000/- €0, AT AT oTeal F ¥ X “5,62,500/- FAU" 3F AT T8
T SO

(i) suF=T (2) 7,
“4,00,000/- FIU” 3T T 9ol & €T 9T, "5,00,000/- FGI" 3(F {7 9Te8 T SATUA|

5810 G1/2024 Q)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Referiad Tiqa sia:eara T Soa, srri;-
UTeq A foF eTeder ST quieTiors 9aeT 1 SEasl 2024 ¥ TH IUMIH T IqFIAH (1) F
FfT I F gHaTe gl
3<% et & e 12 % sufaem (4) ¥, “4,50,000/- 9T ST 4,00,000/- €907 3T T &t *
TITH 9T, FH: “5,62,500/- T 3T 5,00,000/- W 3(F T 9Teg TG STUAT;
3<% A=t & e 13 % sufaem (3) ¥, “4,50,000/- 9T ST 4,00,000/- €907 3T T &l *
TITH 9T, FH: “5,62,500/- T T 5,00,000/- 0" i AT 9Teq TG SO

[T, &. 30/4/2024-ZH e eT-THHIT]
AT 9T SAThedT, T =

TTEIHLOT ATTA—TE =TT 1 STt & o6 AT 5 s[qerett o & St F:ia & Feft oft =af=e & RBa afoger =

EREENECEEIR

feoqur: g Fem, 9 F T, AETER, AN 2, W 3, 39- T (i) # 9ALA. geid 831(h) e 29 T,

2016 3T TTera foFT 10 o o |1, derrs 31(3r), a9 9 S=ady, 2020 =T fay a7e "enfad
o T o

MINISTRY OF CORPORATE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 10th September, 2024.

G.S.R. 560(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (zd) of sub-section (2) of section 239 read

with sub-section (5) of section 189 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016 (31 of 2016), the Central
Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India
(Salary, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service of Chairperson and members) Rules, 2016, namely:—

1.

(1) These rules may be called the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Salary, Allowances and other
Terms and Conditions of Service of Chairperson and members) Amendment Rules, 2024.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

In the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Salary, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of
Service of Chairperson and members) Rules, 2016, (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 4, —

(i) In sub-rule (1), for the words and figures “Rs.4,50,000/-”, the words and figures
“Rs.5,62,500/-” shall be substituted;

(if)  Insub-rule (2),
(@) for the words and figures “Rs.4,00,000/-”, the words and figures “Rs.5,00,000/-" shall be substituted;
(b) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

Provided that the Chairperson and whole-time member shall be entitled to a salary under this sub-rule
and sub-rule (1) from the 1% day of January, 2024.

In rule 12 of the said rules, in sub-rule (4), for the words and figures “Rs.4,50,000/- and Rs.4,00,000/-”, the
words and figures “Rs.5,62,500/- and Rs.5,00,000/-" shall respectively be substituted.



[¢TRT [I—=vE 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

4, In rule 13 of the said rules, in sub-rule (3), for the words and figures “Rs.4,50,000/- and Rs.4,00,000/-”, the
words and figures “Rs.5,62,500/- and Rs.5,00,000/-" shall respectively be substituted.

[F. No. 30/4/2024-Insolvency-MCA]

ANITA SHAH AKELLA, Jt. Secy.

Explanatory Memorandum.—It is hereby declared that by issuing the notification with retrospective effect, the interest of no
person shall be adversely affected.

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide
G.S.R. 831(E) dated 29th August, 2016 and last amended vide number G.S.R. 31(E), dated the 9™ January, 2020.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  cxyesicumar

SRIVASTAVA




		2024-09-10T23:00:41+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




